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  2004-08-30  A  close  relationship  exists
between  GIS  and  numerous  applications,
including  cartography,  photogrammetry,
geodesy,  surveying,  computer  and
information  science,  and  statistics,  among
others. Scientists coined the term geographic
information science (GIScience) to describe

the  theory  behind  these  fields.  A  Research
Agenda for Geographic Information Science
extensively  deta i ls  the  issues  and
fundamental scientific problems that must be
solved if the use of GIS in these and other
fields  is  to  advance.  Immediately  following
the founding of the University Consortium for
Geographic Information Science (UCGIS), the
group  identified  in  a  Research  Agenda  the
topics that represented major challenges to
the  GIS  research  community.  The  first
chapter of this book delivers an introduction
to the agenda and to the collective guidance
that  the  agenda  provides  to  researchers.
Chapters 2-10 discuss nine original research
challenges. Chapters 11-14 provide the basis
of the agenda's four Emerging Themes. Each
chapter, written by researchers involved in
the conception of the topics, discusses basic
research elements, the UCGIS approach, the
need  for  the  National  research  agenda,
contributions to knowledge and society, and
offers a complete set of references. The final
section draws general conclusions about the
UCGIS  approach  and  the  defined  research
challenges.  The  first  chapter  of  this  book
delivers an introduction to the agenda and to
the  collective  guidance  that  the  agenda
provides  to  researchers  Chapters  2  10
discuss  nine  original  research  challenges

  2010-10-12  Drawing  on  the  literature
concerning  effective  Payment  for  Ecosystem
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Services  (PES)  programmes  and  on  more
than  30  case  studies,  this  book  aims  to
identify  good  practice  in  the  design  and
implementation of PES programmes so as to
enhance  their  environmental  and  cost
effectiveness.  Drawing  on  the  literature
concerning  effective  Payment  for  Ecosystem
Services PES programmes and on more than
30 case studies this  book aims to identify
g o o d  p r a c t i c e  i n  t h e  d e s i g n  a n d
implementation of PES programmes so as to
enhance

  2011-10-31 Computer science provides a
powerful  tool  that  was  virtually  unknown
three generations ago. Some of the classical
fields of knowledge are geodesy (surveying),
cartography,  and  geography.  Electronics
have  revolutionized  geodetic  methods.
Cartography has faced the dominance of the
computer  that  results  in  simplified
cartographic  products.  All  three  fields  make
use of basic components such as the Internet
and  databases.  The  Springer  Handbook  of
Geographic Information is organized in three
parts,  Basics,  Geographic  Information  and
Applications. Some parts of the basics belong
to  the  larger  field  of  computer  science.
However, the reader gets a comprehensive
view on geographic information because the
topics selected from computer science have
a close relation to  geographic  information.
The  Springer  Handbook  of  Geographic
Information  is  written  for  scientists  at
universities and industry as well as advanced
and  PhD students.  All  three  fields  make  use

of  basic  components  such  as  the  Internet
and  databases  The  Springer  Handbook  of
Geographic Information is organized in three
parts  Basics  Geographic  Information  and
Applications

  1988-05-26

  2024

  2016-02-03  This  book  is  the  result  of
invited  and  competitive  submissions  to  a
2015  academic  institute  on  Advancing
Geographic  Information  Science:  The  Past
and Next Twenty Years. A core goal of the
institute  was  to  review  the  research
challenges  of  the  past  twenty  years  and
discuss  emerging  challenges  of  the  next
twenty. This book is the result of invited and
competitive submissions to a 2015 academic
inst i tute  on  Advancing  Geographic
Information  Science  The  Past  and  Next
Twenty  Years

  2010  Through  its  presentation  of  a
holistic  view  of  land  management  for
sustainable development,  this  text  outlines
basic  principles  of  land  administration
applicable to all countries and their divergent
needs. Through its presentation of a holistic
view  of  land  management  for  sustainable
development  this  text  outlines  basic
principles  of  land administration applicable
to all countries and their divergent needs
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  1992-03-19 The study and application of
spatial  information  systems  have  been
developed  primarily  from  the  use  of
computers  in  the  geosciences.  These
systems  have  the  principle  functions  of
captur ing ,  s tor ing ,  represent ing ,
manipulating, and displaying data in 2-D and
3-D worlds. This book approaches its subject
from  the  perspectives  of  informatics  and
geography,  present ing  methods  of
conceptual modeling developed in computer
science  that  provide  valuable  aids  for
resolving spatial  problems. This book is an

essential  textbook  for  both  students  and
practitioners. It is indispensable for academic
geographers,  computer  scientists,  and  the
GIS  professional.  Serves  as  the  first
comprehensive  textbook  on  the  field  of
Spatial Information Systems (also known as
Geographic  Information  Systems)  Contains
extensive  illustrations  Presents  numerous
detailed examples This book approaches its
subject from the perspectives of informatics
and  geography  presenting  methods  of
conceptual modeling developed in computer
science  that  provide  valuable  aids  for
resolving  spatial  problems


